
Prayer Call April 25, 2023 – Massachusetts 
 
Clay Nash:  Well, good evening, it’s 9 pm and we are going to be praying, declaring, 
and decreeing over the State of Massachusetts tonight, and it’s going to be a great call, 
strong call and this is our final week.  We will be finishing up on Friday with 
Pennsylvania.  Tomorrow at 2:22 we’ll pray for West Virginia and then on Thursday we’ll 
pray for Rhode Island and then we’ll finish up with Pennsylvania.  Very interesting, 
Intercessors for America (IFA) are going around all 50 states, I was just informed, and 
they began yesterday with Pennsylvania the first state they are going to, and they are 
moving, and we are ending up with it.  We chose to go with the order that Chuck and 
Dutch chose back during the 50-state tour.  The Lord spoke to me very clearly, they 
were more led of the Spirit than they even realized at that time. 
 
If you would like to purchase the videos from the Josiah Company Convocation that was 
last week, go to my website (claynash.org) - go to the store.  Every dollar you pay for 
these will go into the war chest to hold additional Josiah Company Convocations.  We 
are going to move them around the United States.  We don’t know who many we will do, 
but we are going to do more, and we are getting a strategy now for it and we are 
praying. 
 
Go ahead Pat, I’m going to call on you next, remember calls are recorded and 
transcribed on my website.  Alright Pat what’s in your heart, you’ve got a word for this 
great state, what’s God saying?  
 
Pat McManus:  Thank you Clay for the opportunity.  I do have a word, it’s not a very 
long word, for Massachusetts but something that I just felt very strong in.  So, 
Massachusetts I’m releasing the sound of my ways in the land.  I am causing My Word 
to come forth in a new way - prepare your heart to hear the power of my ways.  I am 
setting a new strategy that will cause my ways to be seen and a new compact to the 
heard.  I am releasing and assigning of a new release of my way, my word and my will 
and the strategies will come forth with authority and power.  Be ready for the time of 
shifting is at hand.  Be ready to advance with the authority throughout the land.   
 
Father, we thank you that you are igniting a new compact in the State of Massachusetts 
that even as Gideon-the sword of the Lord-is being released, that there will be a sound 
of awakening and a clear place of reformation in the land of Massachusetts.  So, we 
thank you Father for the advancing of your Word, the expression of your heart and the 
purpose of your way to be seen and heard on the land.  We give you honor and praise.  
In Jesus’ name.  Amen and Amen.  
 
Clay Nash:  Regina, I’m going to call on you next: 
 
Regina Shank:  Thank you Clay.  I was reading out of Jeremiah 31 - I think verse 15 - 
and it has to do with Massachusetts.  It says “A cry is heard in Ramah, deep anguish 
and bitter weeping Rachel weeps for her children”.  



And that’s one of the things I had for the State of Massachusetts.  And I want to read 
this prophetic word to them:  
 
“The altar of Molech in Massachusetts must be taken down.  The blood cries out for 
justice.  Purposes for which these babies were to be born are hanging in the heavenlies.  
This is serious.  This is a covenant with death.  I decree over you Massachusetts – your 
covenant with death will be annulled and your agreement with Sheol, the place of the 
dead, will not stand.  Death cannot be your deliverer, Massachusetts.  You have been 
called the ‘mother of the nation’.  Has your womb been invaded by death that you refuse 
to step into your purpose as a birthing place for My Glory.  This is not a time to say, 
“whatever will be-will be”.  It is not a time to say, “it is what it is”.  It is the time to decree:  
The spirit of death will leave our state, the spirit of abortion will not prevail in 
Massachusetts.  Arise Oh Lord and let Your enemies be scattered.  God – the source of 
life - will have his deliverers birthed in the mother of the nation state.   
 
Massachusetts your past will not determine your future.  I am calling you to war.  Your 
battle is not against flesh and blood, but against principalities and powers of darkness.  
The weapons you fight with are not carnal, but mighty through God to the pulling down 
of strongholds.  Pull it down.  Dismantle it, dismantle the altar of Molech.  Let the plump 
line of my righteousness and the measuring line of my justice be dropped and let the 
State come into alignment with my purposes.  Statesmen came to Massachusetts to set 
up the government of this nation.  Let statesmen and stateswomen arise in 
Massachusetts to set up my government.  The government is on my shoulders and of 
the increase of my government and peace there will be no end.  Do not give in to 
fatalism or judge by what your eyes see.  I AM THAT I AM AND I AM ABLE.  Stand with 
me, stand for me.  We will bring forth freedom, life, and victory.  I will send you my 
statemen and my stateswomen.  Receive them for they will help you shift your state 
from death to life.  It is time to cross over – I am the bridge. 
 
I just want to say, I was born in Massachusetts and so this state means quite a bit to me 
as the mother of the nation.  And so Lord we decree over Massachusetts that you will 
be a birthing center for the deliverers of America.  You will be a birthing center to birth 
my will and purpose in the earth says the Lord.  You will rise up out of that place of 
degradation and shame and death and you will step up into the place that I have called 
you for this nation.  For your purpose has been moved by the enemy, your purpose has 
been shaken, but the Lord is saying to you today Massachusetts – rise up and be who 
you are called to be.   
 
So, Father we decree over this State – Your name will be exalted in Massachusetts.  
That You will put down one and exalt another and you will have those that love life.  And 
we decree to Massachusetts - Jesus said I AM the way, the truth, and the Life.  And So, 
we speak life to that state, we speak shift to that state and we say Massachusetts come 
into alignment with God for your purpose.  In Jesus’ name.  Amen. 
 



Clay Nash:   Alright, Regina and Pat, thank you for that beginning, strong beginning, 
strong declarations, and decrees we come into agreement with.  Anne Tate, you are 
with us today, thank you for being on, what’s in your heart?  
 
Anne Tate:  Well, Clay I want to go back as in Ezekiel 37 and re-prophesy into the 
things that were spoken in the 50-State Tour because there were 4 points for 
Massachusetts that Chuck gave.  He said:  
 
We must have full faith:  
 So, I speak full faith into Massachusetts tonight. 
 
We must enter into the weapons of deliverance and stir them up.   
I call for the God of deliverance to visit Massachusetts and bring deliverance of every 
old thing, of every wrong spirit, of every demonic power that has set up there and built 
structures – Lord, we call for the Deliverer to Massachusetts. 
 
We must frustrate the enemy. 
So, Lord, I thank you that as life begins to come into the army in Massachusetts, as 
breath begins to come that they begin to stand up and resist all of the darkness.  I say 
Lord that the army will begin to arise, that breath will fill their lungs, they will begin to 
stand and prophecy and speak and they will stand according to Your Word.   
 
We must fight for our covenant.   
Lord, remind the people of Massachusetts that they have a covenant with you.  So, Lord 
we say that this is the season that those covenant keepers will stand up, have courage, 
have courage and take the land.   
 
And Dutch said “God is coming to bring a great awakening to snatch many from hell”  
Lord, we call for your Spirit to come, if it comes to Massachusetts, since she is the 
‘mother of our nation’ it will spread throughout the other states.  And so, Lord we call for 
the deliverer to come to Massachusetts, and for the power of God to begin to come and 
energize and give courage and cause them to stand up on their feet.  And the Lord is 
going to break through Massachusetts and many of his enemies will become friends – 
Lord, we ask you to open the gates of Massachusetts. Throw your Spirit in there Lord 
until they are rejuvenated, renewed, revisited, standing up in covenant, In the Name of 
Jesus and Lord we say that you are even today changing the curses into blessings in 
Massachusetts.  In the Name of Jesus.   Amen 
 
Clay Nash:  Amen, we stand in agreement Anne.  Timothy, there in Louisiana, what’s in 
your heart. 
 
Timothy Carscadden:  Thank you Clay and blessings to everybody praying tonight and 
lifting up this important state of Massachusetts.  I felt that as I prayed before the call 
tonight, they are in real serious position as a state and so I think tonight is appropriate 
that we are covering them and praying for them.  I pray that even if there’s not many 



representations here tonight on the call we can still pray and pour into them.  Here’s 
what I heard:  
 
The Lord said the former things of your foundation and purpose are calling for an 
awakening.   
 
I don’t know how to explain it but I saw the ground crying out back to its foundation and 
purpose.  The Lord said, “The unrighteousness of your political leaders has suppressed 
the truth within Massachusetts from being heard -- But the Lord would say that truth 
always has prevailed, and the Spirit of Truth is moving in your halls of government to 
find vessels of honor to speak through”.  The Lord would say to the intercessors in 
Massachusetts – Pray for the voices to have ears to hear this Spirit of Truth as it begins 
to move down these halls.   
 
Then I heard then:  You are a state that is wavering between 2 opinions.  The Lord 
says, choose the way of the Lord and watch Him move on your behalf. 
 
Then the Lord showed me this – I saw a vision - The Lord says a voice will come forth 
from the east side of Boston to build a highway for others to travel toward change.  
Change is coming regardless the Lord says, let it be the change for good by interceding 
for this needed transformation. 
 
I had a whole sense when I was praying and having visions, was that Massachusetts is 
in this place where they are having to choose between these 2 opinions.  So, we want 
to help them, we want push them to choose the Lord.  So Father right now I pray for 
Massachusetts – and that Lord that this movement of Truth that you want to see 
happen, the Spirit of Truth Lord that would set the captives free, that would bring about 
the needed transformation, change in Massachusetts, we pray Lord that there would be 
those that would have ears to hear what the Spirit is saying as the Spirit of Truth is 
coming and Lord I thank you – We cry out Massachusetts – choose the Lord, choose 
the ways of the Lord now for there’s hope for your future  
 
God, we thank you that the foundation and purpose of Massachusetts is calling again 
for this Great Awakening – let it happen again within the borders of Massachusetts.  We 
decree that tonight In Jesus name, Amen.  Thank you, Clay.  
 
Clay Nash:  David Hertel, I see you online, what’s in our heart.  
 
David Hertel:  Hello, just got on – so I don’t know what been prayed or what’s been 
said.  But of course we are praying for Massachusetts as I understand it and Boston 
stands out as the host of this satancon coming up this Friday.  Of course, it’s a satancon 
job, an act of duping or swindling to get one’s way – a con job means to get others to 
misplace their confidence – so we just declare Psalm 107:13-16 over them.  

NKJV  



13 Then they cried out to the LORD in their trouble, 

And He saved them out of their distresses. 

14 He brought them out of darkness and the shadow of death, 

And broke their chains in pieces. 

15 Oh, that men would give thanks to the LORD for His goodness, 

And for His wonderful works to the children of men! 

16 For He has broken the gates of bronze, 

And cut the bars of iron in two. 

So we thank you Lord that you are breaking down the chains and shattering them into 
pieces that this satancon is going to be a conflict, it’s going to fall flat, it’s going to do no 
spiritual advancement of the kingdom of darkness and it will be a big fat zero in satan’s 
reputation and so Lord we thank you that the prophetic sign for the destruction of 
satan’s kingdom of the things that are attached to it and supporting it and representing 
is the “fantasmics” dragon in Disney World last week that erupted in flames from the 
face and the head first and was completely consumed by fire despite the efforts to 
quench it.   
 
So we just thank you Lord that satancon will not cause any harm or destruction and 
especially by supernatural means.  So, it is declared Hebrews 12:28-29  
 

28 Therefore let us be grateful for receiving a kingdom that cannot be shaken, and 
thus let us offer to God acceptable worship, with reverence and awe, 29 for our God is a 
consuming fire. 
 
We declare Boston you shall come under the Lordship of Jesus Christ and 
Massachusetts you shall be saved and the Kingdom of God shall advance in you and it 
will come like a “D-12 bulldozer” caterpillar coming over satan’s efforts and establishing 
the kingdom of God and we will give you all the Glory God, In Jesus’ name.  Amen 
 
Clay Nash:  I just declare that even as Chuck prophesied back in the 50-State Tour that 
God is still showing the church, the ecclesia, in Massachusetts how to follow Him in a 
new way.  I thank you that Massachusetts is very fluid and flexible and I declare that as 
one thing dries up, there’s going to be a willingness to change and to move into a new 
environment.   
 
We call forth for a new dimension even again for the words of knowledge there.  We 
declare this gift is activated already due to the words back in 2003 and 2004 but we 
declare that Word is going to another level.  Bring forth words of knowledge, bring forth 
words of wisdom, release it Father into this great State and cause a tremendous turn 
around.   
 
Father, we declare the blood and the Word – the blood of Christ and the Word of God 
around the State of Massachusetts.  We declare what these satan activists are seeking 



to do – their words are going to fall to the ground and be trodden underneath.  We 
declare their words will not have any effect.  
 
We declare that many, not just a few, many are going to have an encounter with the 
Lord Jesus Christ and in that encounter, they are going to turn away from the father of 
lies satan and they are going to turn to God and give their hearts to God – you will take 
out of them stoney hearts and put in hearts of flesh.   
 
We bind up any witchcraft, we bind up any curses, we bind up any destruction that will 
come out of that meeting and we declare that the strong man over Massachusetts Is 
Jesus Christ the Son of God.  We declare that today and we do so in Yeshua’s name.  
Amen and Amen 
 
   
 
  
 
 
  
 


